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8 The basic context and structure
of Hegel's Philosophy of Right

My aim in this essay is to sketch the political and philosophical
context of Hegel's Philosophy of Right and to reconstruct the basic
aim and structure of its main argument.1 I argue that Hegel is a
reform-minded liberal who based his political philosophy on the
analysis and fulfillment of individual human freedom. Hegel gave
this theme a profound twist through his social conception of human
individuals. He argued that individual autonomy can be achieved
only within a communal context.

II

To understand Hegel's political views, it is helpful to see how they
stand with regard to conservatism, romanticism, and liberalism. He-
gel has been accused of conservatism or worse. The most common
basis for this charge is Hegel's claim that what is rational is actual
and what is actual is rational (Preface 24/20). This claim has been
taken as a blanket endorsement of the status quo, but in the para-
graph headed by this statement, Hegel distinguished between phe-
nomena that embody a rational structure and those that do not. The
mere fact that a state exists, on Hegel's view, does not entail that it
is either rational or, in Hegel's technical sense, "actual." Hegel's
distinction between existence and actuality is tied to his metaphys-
ics, according to which the universe's rational structure progres-
sively actualizes itself. In the political sphere, this means that social
institutions aspire and tend to achieve a fundamentally rational
form. The basis of this view cannot be explored here. For present
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purposes it suffices to note that Hegel's slogan is not a blanket
endorsement of extant institutions.2 This does not, however, deter-
mine where Hegel's politics lie in the political spectrum. That re-
quires determining what political institutions Hegel thought were
rational and why.

Hegel has been branded a conservative by associating him with
the historical school of jurisprudence, whose most prominent repre-
sentative was Friedrich Karl von Savigny. In a phrase, the historical
school of jurisprudence sought to justify (then) contemporary Get-
man law by tracing its roots back to Roman law. Hegel refuted this
main principle of the historical school by charging it with the ge-
netic fallacy - with a twist. Instead of justifying laws by determin-
ing their origins in specific historical circumstances, this effort
delegitimizes laws because those circumstances no longer exist
(§3R)!3 The historical school also opposed codification of civil law
because they viewed law as an organic growth thoroughly rooted in a
changing society. Codification appeared to them to be antithetical to
an organic conception of law and society. Hegel opposed the histori-
cal school on this point, too, firmly insisting on the need for law
codified and promulgated in the national language as a key element
in achieving rational freedom (§§258R, 21 iR).

Hegel has also been styled the philosopher of the Prussian Res-
tauiation. This is incredible, in view of Hegel's merciless attack on
the leading figure of the Restauration, Karl Ludwig von Haller, au-
thor of Restauration der Staatswissenschaft (1818). Haller appealed
to a version of natural law and so is subject to Hegel's criticisms of
natural law in general (see below). Haller's version of natural law
equated natural law with divine law, and regarded the natural might
of the stronger as the basis for their natural right to rule. Haller
opposed any binding legal codification, regarding a code only as a
way princes could choose to inform judges of their commands. Hegel
condemned Haller's view that legal codes are optional and reiterated
the irrelevance of historical origins for determining matters of legiti-
macy (§2i9R; cf. §25 8R). Hegel further condemned Haller's anti-
rationalism and opposition to codification in a long paragraph and an
even longer note appended to it (§258R & N). Hegel's tone in these
passages is extremely sharp and makes plain his opposition to the
main tenets of the Restauration.*

Hegel has also been taken as a conservative because he espouses
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an organic conception of individuals and society. Most organic theo-
ries at the time, such as Burke's, were conservative. Organicism
opposes atomistic individualism by holding that people do not enter
society fully formed in order to satisfy their pre- or non-social aims
and interests. According to organic views, individuals are formed,
together with their needs, aims, and ways of thinking, within the
social group to which they belong. An organic view becomes specifi-
cally conservative if it additionally holds that individuals have no
conception of themselves apart from their group, that individuals
cannot escape their group because it has formed their identities and
needs, that individuals thus are incapable of evaluating society by
pre- or non-social standards, and that because individuals are formed
by their society's cultural traditions and social and political institu-
tions, their society also suits them.

Hegel did espouse an organic conception of individuals and society.
However, it is crucial to understand how he recast the issue. Typically
it is supposed that there are two positions on this issue. Either indi-
viduals are more fundamental than or are in principle independent of
society, or vice versa: society is more basic than or "prior to" human
individuals. Hegel realized that these two options form a false dichot-
omy. Briefly, Hegel held that individuals are fundamentally social
practitioners. Everything one does, says, or thinks is formed in the
context of social practices that provide material and conceptual re-
sources, objects of desire, skills, procedures, and the like. No one acts
on the general, merely biological needs for food, safety, companion-
ship, or sex; and no one seeks food, safety, companionship, or sex in
general. Rather, one acts on much more specific needs for much more
specific kinds of objects that fulfill those needs, and one acts to
achieve one's aims in quite specific ways; one's society deeply condi-
tions one's ends because it provides specific objects that meet those
ends, and it specifies procedures for obtaining them. Even so, Hegel
realized that this fact does not render individuals subservient to soci-
ety. First, what individuals do depends on their own response to their
social context. In addition, Hegel argued that there are no individuals,
no social practitioners, without social practices, and vice versa, there
are no social practices without social practitioners - without indi-
viduals who learn, participate in, perpetuate, and who modify those
social practices as needed to meet their changing needs, aims, and
circumstances. The issue of the ontological priority of individuals or
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society is bogus.' Hegel's views have been widely misunderstood and
castigated by critics who were beholden to a false dichotomy.

Conservatives of a certain stripe recognize that social institutions
and practices are subject to change in the face of changing circum-
stances; Hegel's stress on the corrigibility of social practices alone
does not absolve him of conservatism. Reform conservatives, as they
may be called, do not believe in progress, but will adapt the status
quo piecemeal to accommodate ineluctable social, economic, and
political changes. Like conservatives in general, reform conserva-
tives are skeptical about our ability to comprehend society ratio-
nally, much less to reconstruct it rationally. They place much more
trust in customs, traditions, or even prejudice than in human reason,
and they regard the non-rational components of human nature as the
foundation of society and as a bulwark against the aspirations of
rationalist reformers.6 Conservatives thus stress the importance of a
society's molding of individual character and sentiment to inculcate
allegiance to one's society. In conservative political thought, feelings
of patriotism are fundamental to political allegiance.

Hegel acknowledged the force of Romantic criticisms of the En-
lightenment's a-historical, a-social, individualist account of reason,
but he held strong Enlightenment ideals concerning human rational-
ity. For Hegel, as for Kant, human rationality is the key to autonomy,
to self-determination, and Hegel stressed this point as Kant's great
contribution to practical philosophy (§i35R). Hegel regarded the de-
mand for rational understanding and justification of norms and insti-
tutions as the hallmark of modern times/ and he sought an account
of society and government that met that demand (Preface 26/21). He
also held that, although important, patriotism is too weak and insuf-
ficiently rational a basis for a modern state (§273R). In this regard,
Hegel was a rationalist in principle, not out of rear-guard action, and
so in this crucial regard Hegel was not a conservative, not even a
reform conservative. He firmly believed in historical progress as a
rational process (§§342, 343, 345). Finally, Hegel's organicism is not
inherently conservative because he stressed that a society's prac-
tices are subject to rational criticism and revision. This point has
been overlooked due to the assumption that rational criticism must
be based on non-social standards. Hegel denied this assumption and
developed subtle accounts of internal criticism, of self-criticism, and
of the social bases for evaluating norms and principles. These views
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cannot be explored here,8 but they are crucial for understanding the
fundamental role assigned to social practices in Hegel's political
philosophy.

Hegel is also reputed to be the philosopher of the reactionary
Prussian state. In fact, Hegel's political philosophy became promi-
nent during a fortunate break in conservative dominance. Conserva-
tive forces in Germany were in retreat after the Battle of Jena in
1806. The Prussian Restoration began reversing this political trend
in 1815 and achieved dominance only after Hegel's death in 1831.
Hegel's political philosophy is rightly associated with the core of an
energetic liberal reform movement led by Prime Minister Baron Karl
vom Stein, Prince Karl August von Hardenberg, Wilhelm von Hum-
bolt, and Baron von Altenstein. The details of Stein's and Hegel's
views converged significantly, and Altenstein and Hegel agreed on a
number of fundamentals.' Among the reforms instituted by Stein
were the abolition of trade barriers between provinces, the break-up
of the ossified Guild system, and improvements of roads and canals
for the sake of commerce. Hardenberg recognized the civil rights of
Jews and championed the political interests of the middle class.
Altenstein brought Hegel to Berlin in 1818 and fostered the Hegelian
school at the University of Berlin, in part as a bulwark against Ro-
mantics and the Historical School. Hegel first published the Philoso-
phy of Right while at Berlin in 1821.

There was a deep split between these ministers and both the con-
servative nobility and the superstitious and reactionary king, Frie-
drich Willhelm III. The king was suspicious and fearful of Stein, and
the nobility regarded both Stein and Hardenberg as the worst of
republicans. Although the king twice promised a constitution, he
probably never intended to provide one. The king belonged to the
Rosicrucians, an anti-scientific cabalistic Christian sect devoted to
the occult,10 and he was quite taken with Haller's Restauration der
Staatswissenschaft. He showed his antipathy to sharing power with
the middle class by suppressing Gorres's newspaper and book, which
advocated these policies, and by ordering his arrest.

Hegel distinguished between the old absolutist form of monarchy
and the modern constitutional form, and he held that the constitu-
tional form is the sole rational form worthy of the times (§273).
Hegel thus took a decisive and progressive stand on a burning issue
in Prussia at the time. Hegel also advocated a permanent representa-
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tive assembly, although none was to exist in Prussia until 1848. In
attacking Savigny and especially Haller, Hegel vociferously attacked
views shared by the king. Moreover, his admonition near the end of
the Preface to dance in the cross of the present was directed against
other-worldliness, in particular, that of the Rosicrucians - including
that of the king (Preface 26/22)!11

Hegel's differences with the Prussian conservatives, the landed
nobility or Junkets, deserve comment. The Junkers favored a monar-
chy that was independent of popular consent but was nevertheless
limited by the nobility's positions in the military, in government,
and as land owners. Haller was the political philosopher most
closely associated with the Junker aspiration to reestablish a feudal
state. Hegel opposed these conservative elements. He put the govern-
ment bureaucracy in the hands of an educated middle class instead
of the nobility (§297). He also placed the landed classes in the upper
house of his representative assembly, where they would have to
function under pressure from the crown above and from the commer-
cial classes from below (§304; cf. §302 & R). This institutional ar-
rangement would preclude a return to the feudal "dualistic state"
(where power was shared between the king and landed nobility) and
would thwart independent political action by the estates, including
the landed nobility. In sum, Hegel opposed all the conservative
forces of his day.

Hegel unquestionably shares some themes with Romanticism, for
example, an organicism according to which things are essentially
related by their contrasts, and a social conception of individuals.
Romantics loved symbols and viewed the monarch as a symbol of
political unity. Hegel's governmental arrangements vaguely resem-
ble Novalis's proposal.12 The Romantic Gdrres advocated a corpo-
rate constitution that shared political power with the provinces and
the middle class. Even so, when one examines their respective treat-
ments of these themes, the differences between Hegel and the Ro-
mantics strongly predominate.

In style, Romantics tended to be epigrammatic and intuitive or
inspirational rather than rationally systematic or argumentative.
They began as fanatic individualists, but they came to view individu-
als as lacking self-sufficiency, a defect to be corrected by member-
ship in an organically organized society.'3 Romantics were suspi-
cious of capitalism; they venerated the nobility and denigrated the
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bourgeois as an acquiescent philistine. They fled from their present
dissatisfactions into an idealized feudal age. They held that individu-
als are related to the state through devotion and veneration. They
based state authority on religion, and many Romantics reacted
against rationalism by converting to Catholicism. Novalis even de-
nounced Protestantism as an interruption of the organic develop-
ment of humanity.

On all these counts, Hegel differed unequivocally with Romanti-
cism. Hegel regarded the Reformation as an important contribution
to the historical development of autonomous, morally reflective in-
dividuals who rightly require rational justification for acts and insti-
tutions (Preface 27/22).n He denied that religious authority is the
basis of state authority (§27oR), and in his lectures he castigated the
Romantics' conversions to Catholicism as willful capitulation to
intellectual servitude (§i4iZ).Is When Hegel grandiloquently de-
scribed the state as God standing in the world (§27oR), his point was
not to divinize the state. One main point of this remark is best
understood against the backdrop of the Dialectic of Kant's Second
Critique. According to Kant, happiness results from fulfilling one's
inclinations. For moral agents, on Kant's view, happiness is a gift of
divine grace, first, because it's luck that one's causally determined
inclinations are morally permissible, and second, because God is
required to ensure that one has the luck and ability to achieve one's
morally permissible ends.16 In ways indicated below, Hegel's state is
designed to minister to both these allegedly divine tasks.

Although Hegel sought to incorporate many traditional elements,
such as corporations, in his view of society, he did so because he
thought that they could serve a current rational purpose. Hegel re-
jected any retreat to a prior age or circumstance. His detailed politi-
cal studies of Wurttemberg taught him what the Romantics never
realized, that reestablishing a feudal order could not provide a stable
state." He looked to the middle class as a crucial foundation of any
modern state, both in commerce and in the civil service. Hegel quali-
fied his approval of capitalism (§236), but he did not oppose it and
indeed based his political philosophy on a careful rethinking of mod-
ern political economy.

Having distinguished Hegel's views from conservatism and Ro-
manticism, I now turn to his stance toward liberalism, in particular
to his views on political autonomy, natural law, the social contract
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tradition, and utilitarianism. Modern liberalism typically has up-
held two important principles. One is the principle of individual
autonomy, that each person is Competent to and ought to participate
in making law. The other principle is the rule of justice, the idea that
there are standards any law must meet to be good or just. Providing
for individual autonomy requires coordinating individual decisions
in order to maintain a viable social unit, and conjoining these two
principles requires explaining the relationship between autonomous
individuals and objective standards of justice. There are three gen-
eral strategies explaining this relationship. One strategy holds that
the general will is an aggregate of individual wills. Another holds
that correct policy is independent of individual wills and awaits
their discovery. The third, collective strategy holds that there is a
general or collective will that is not simply a function of individual
wills and is not simply a reflection of some antecedent correct princi-
ple.18 Hegel took a collective approach to reconciling the two liberal
principles of individual autonomy and the rule of law. In his view,
individuals do play a crucial role in determining the content of law,
although it is not performed by plebiscite. Individuals play a role in
forming the content of law by maintaining and modifying social
practices as needed to secure their freedom and their individual
ends. Those social practices necessary for achieving freedom are, in
Hegel's view, the proper basis of and content for statutory law. (I
return to this point below.)

Hegel's rejection of two standard liberal strategies for justifying
normative principles may be considered together, since Hegel makes
analogous criticisms of both. One strategy for justifying normative
principles or claims, especially in morals, is to appeal to conscience.
Another strategy, especially in politics, is to appeal to natural law or,
analogously, to natural rights. In either case, one appeals to a kind of
self-evidence to justify one's claim or principle. Hegel disputed such
alleged "self-evidence" for two basic reasons. First, theories of self-
evidence either conflate or fail properly to distinguish between being
certain that something is true, and thus believing it, and some-
thing's being true, and thus being certain of it. Second, he knew that
the claims allegedly justified by appeals to conscience or to natural
law are diverse and even mutually incompatible. A main desidera-
tum for any mode of justification is to sort justified from unjustified
claims, in order to help sort true from false claims. This is especially
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important for the controversies in our collective moral and political
life. Any mode of justification that can warrant a claim and its
negation fails to meet this basic desideratum and is, as such, inade-
quate. Appeals to conscience or to natural law fail to meet this basic
requirement.19 Hegel also held that appeals to natural law or con-
science tend to omit relevant principles or considerations. This pro-
duces incomplete accounts of an issue, what Hegel called one-sided
or abstract accounts.20 Although Hegel disagreed fundamentally
with standard approaches to determining the content of natural law,
he nevertheless upheld and revamped a basic principle of natural
law, namely, that right is a function of freedom of the individual
will. This principle is fundamental to his argument in the Philoso-
phy of Right.

Hegel's objections to the social contract tradition are merely sug-
gested in the Philosophy of Right. They may be summarized briefly.
Hegel argued that the state of nature is arbitrarily contrived to ob-
tain the theorist's desired outcomes, and that abstracting from any
points that might be regarded as inessential, arbitrary, or controver-
sial would empty the state of nature of all descriptive content.11 The
principles attributed to the state of nature often have the same sort
of justification as natural laws and suffer the same deficiencies.
Most important, the social contract misrepresents the nature of our
membership in society. Our membership in society is inevitable,
necessary, and constitutive of much of our character, whereas the
social contract models our membership on an elective association of
otherwise independent individuals (§§75R, 100R, 258R, 281R). View-
ing membership in society in this way misrepresents ourselves as
mutually independent parties to a fictitious contract whereby we
agree to join society, or to form a government, in order to achieve
some specified range of antecedent interests we independently
choose to pursue. This thwarts recognizing and understanding the
social dimensions of human life. On this basis, laws or principles of
justice can only be seen as restricting individual freedom of action in
return for security and peaceful coexistence (§29)." Hegel stressed
instead the role of laws and principles of justice as enabling condi-
tions for a wide range of aspects of character development and indi-
vidual action. On this basis he claimed to sketch a far more detailed
and accurate account of our social involvements and our political
allegiance. Hegel agreed with the social contract tradition that mem-
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bership in society and obedience to government are matters that
require rational justification, but he sought this justification in ra-
tional insight into the nature of our involvement in actual institu-
tions (Preface 24-26/20-22, §3iR, cf. §i89R). Taken together, He-
gel's most-fundamental objection to the social contract tradition is
that the abstractions used by social contract theories to describe the
state of nature, and to describe persons in that state, evade a whole
range of benefits and obligations we have as members of a politically
organized society (including the obligation to defend the state
[§§325, 326]). Consequently, social contract theory is implicitly skep-
tical about those benefits and obligations and is morally and politi-
cally irresponsible, since it precludes their proper recognition and
analysis. Hegel's objections to the social contract tradition do not,
however, preclude him from sharing many issues and points of doc-
trine with that tradition.

Hegel agreed with one of Kant's main criticisms of utilitarianism,
that it cannot account or provide for human autonomy because it
takes given desires as the basic locus of value and source of ends.1'
He believed that utilitarianism does not take proper account of the
intellectual character of the will; that it involves too atomistic a
view of individuals, too instrumental a view of the state and the
government; and that it is incompatible with the proper basis of
right, which rests on freedom and autonomy. He regarded the con-
cept of utility as an important component of an intelligent grasp of
one's alternative courses of action and of the coherence of one's
long-range plans (§§20, 63, 77). He also regarded utility writ large,
welfare, as a fundamental component of the aims of individuals and
organizations and a basic responsibility of a number of civil institu-
tions (§§123, 125, 128-30). However, he viewed freedom as a more-
fundamental value than utility - considerations of utility cannot jus-
tify sacrificing freedom or individual rights (§§125, 126)-and he
regarded securing freedom as the most-basic obligation of govern-
mental institutions. Indeed, Hegel regarded happiness as beyond the
competence of political arrangements. A rational state and its gov-
ernment are obliged to secure the conditions for the success of indi-
vidual actions; they are not obliged to secure success itself, and so
not the happiness it brings. These are Hegel's basic reasons for reject-
ing utilitarianism.

Hegel thus opposed the main forms of liberal thought in his day
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and in our own. I nevertheless maintain that Hegel is a progressive
liberal. One basis for this claim has already been suggested, namely,
that Hegel upheld the liberal principles of individual autonomy and
the rule of law. There is in fact a deep point of continuity between
Hegel and the social contract tradition: both Hegel and the social
contract tradition take the analysis of the individual will and its
freedom as the starting point for justifying basic political principles
and institutions. Indeed, Hegel expressly credits Rousseau with con-
tributing the fundamental idea that the state must be based on the
will (§2s8R).

Ill

Hegel realized that to be relevant to modern life political philosophy
must take economics into account [cf. §i89R). This is especially
important for a view like Hegel's that provides a social analysis of
the origins and justification of normative principles. Early industrial-
ization generated considerable personal and social fragmentation.
Hegel recognized that personal and social fragmentation were two
sides of the same coin and that the solution to either problem must
solve both.1* Hegel realized that the division of labor, which pro-
duces social fragmentation, is not simply an obstacle to an inte-
grated social and political community. Rather, the relations and life-
styles engendered by the division of labor form a substantial set of
practices and norms shared among the members of a modern society.
Hegel discerned in the workings of modern society an increasing
social interdependence that indicated the social, rather than the
atomically individual, nature of human beings. He argued that
achieving community and actualizing freedom are based on recogniz-
ing this common mutual interdependence. Effecting this recogni-
tion and its attendant freedom is the very point and purpose of the
social and political institutions in Hegel's theory of the state.

Hegel's view of the liberating effects of modern economic develop-
ments enabled him to reinterpret Kantian autonomy. Hegel regarded
autonomy of the will, our ability to legislate normative laws to
ourselves, as Kant's most important contribution to practical phi-
losophy (§i35R). Autonomy requires avoiding two kinds of heteron-
omy, the heteronomy of determining how to act on the basis of
naturally given inclinations, and the heteronomy of determining
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how to act on the basis of external authority. Kant's analysis and
defense of autonomy rest on his transcendental idealism. Hegel criti-
cized Kant's transcendental idealism, rejected Kant's metaphysics,
and was very sensitive to ways in which Kant's metaphysics caused
problems for his theory of action, and hence for his moral theory.2?

Hegel shared Kant's aim of avoiding the heteronomy of acting on
naturally given impulses or inclinations. Unlike Kant, Hegel did not
view this as a problem of psychological determinism within the
phenomenal realm. Instead, Hegel viewed this much more as a prob-
lem of self-knowledge and attitude. This is because no mature adult
has inclinations that are causally given by nature; human motives
are a joint product of biological nature, cultural inheritance, and
individual response to circumstance. Hegel avoided the metaphysi-
cal issue of freedom of the will by focusing instead on the moral,
social, and political issue of bringing people to understand how (in a
well-ordered society) their needs, aspirations, and principles form a
rationally acceptable system. This system enables them to lead inte-
grated personal lives, where their individual lives are integrated into
a network of social institutions.

Defending human autonomy requires showing how individuals
are self-legislators, how they give themselves their own principles,
aims, and objects of will. (Hegel called these the "content" of the
will [§9].) The problem of heteronomy is serious because Hegel ar-
gued that the free, rational, spontaneous human will cannot gener-
ate or specify its own principles, aims, or objects a priori (§258R).
The content of the will thus derives from nature, but it must be
transformed into a self-given content: "the drives should become
the rational system of the will's determination; to grasp them thus
in terms of the concept [of the will] is the content of the [philosophi-
cal] science of right" (§19). This statement is crucial; it indicates
that the issue of avoiding natural heteronomy by rationally integrat-
ing our needs, desires, ends, and actions is basic to Hegel's whole
argument in the Philosophy of Right. One reason Hegel viewed hu-
man freedom as a social phenomenon is that through collective
efforts to meet individual needs, natural needs are elaborated into
more-specific needs for the kinds of goods communities make avail-
able to their members. The social elaboration of needs transforms
those needs from a natural level of mere givenness to a social level,
indicating that humans come to give themselves their own needs.
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One of Hegel's most brilliant insights is how the development of
commerce contributes to the development of human enculturation,
a collective process whereby we liberate ourselves from our natu-
rally given needs and desires. Political economy is thus crucial for
overcoming natural heteronomy and to achieving autonomy. Achiev-
ing autonomy from nature is central to Hegel's account of the family
and civil society.

IV

Analyzing the structure of Hegel's argument in the Philosophy of
Right shows that achieving political autonomy is fundamental to
Hegel's analysis of the state and government. Hegel divides his expo-
sition into several distinct parts. His introduction sketches an ac-
count of the will, freedom, and the nature of right. Part One, "Ab-
stract Right," treats principles governing property, its transfer, and
wrongs against property. Part Two, "Morality," treats the rights of
moral subjects, responsibility for one's actions, and a priori theories
of right. Part Three, "Ethical Life" (Sittlichkeit), analyzes the princi-
ples and institutions governing central aspects of rational social life,
including the family, civil society, and the state as a whole, includ-
ing the government.

The Philosophy of Right analyzes the concept of the will (§§4-7,
279R); the main issue is what is required for a will to achieve its
freedom.26 Hegel's introduction indicates two basic requirements for
achieving freedom: achieving one's ends and engaging in actions
voluntarily. Hegel's sense of "voluntary" combines Aristotle's sense
of not regretting one's act after the fact in full view of the actual
consequences (§7 &. R) with Kant's sense of autonomy, of obeying
only laws one legislates for oneself. Acting freely, on Hegel's view,
requires both achieving one's ends and matching one's intentions
with the consequences of one's acts [cf. §§10 & R, 22, 23, 28, 39).
Unintended consequences may give grounds for post facto regret, or
for the sense of being bound by circumstances one did not foresee
and would not desire or approve.

The main question of Hegel's analysis is, What sort of action, in
what sort of context, constitutes this kind of free action? Hegel's
dialectical arguments rely on indirect proof, critically analyzing al-
ternative views that purport to solve this problem. When analyzing
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alternative accounts of freedom, Hegel's main critical question is,
To what extent does the kind of act or intention in question succeed
at its aim? Hegel argued that the conditions for successful free ac-
tion are enormously rich and ultimately involve membership in a
well-ordered state. His argument rests on an unspoken principle
much like Kant's principle of rational willing: Whoever rationally
wills an end is rationally committed to willing the requisite means
or conditions for achieving that end.1? On Hegel's analysis, the most
basic end of the human will is to act freely (§27). Hegel held that
obligations are generated by commitment to the basic end of willing
to be free, and by the consequent commitment to the necessary
legitimate means or conditions for achieving freedom [cf. §26iR).
Correlatively, rights are generated and justified by showing that a
right secures some necessary legitimate means or condition for
achieving freedom (§§4,29, 30,261R). Principles, practices, and insti-
tutions are justified by showing that they play a necessary and irre-
placeable role in achieving freedom.

Hegel's discussion of "abstract right" concerns basic principles of
property rights. It is abstract in three ways. First, actions and princi-
ples are (initially) abstracted from interpersonal relations; second,
they are abstracted from moral reflection; third, they are abstracted
from legal and political institutions. These abstractions are sequen-
tially shed as Hegel's analysis develops. Hegel's argument begins by
analyzing a standard liberal individualist proposal for the most-basic
free act, taking something into possession. He holds that thoroughly
analyzing the presuppositions and the inadequacies of this alleged
basic free act ultimately leads to justifying membership in a specific
kind of modern state.

According to most modern social contract theories, taking some-
thing into possession is the most-elementary free act, at least as
regards political philosophy. For example, according to Locke, the
rights that make such an act intelligible and possible are natural. In
opposition to this view, Hegel expands upon Hume's and Rousseau's
lesson that property rights are not natural, but are founded on con-
ventions.28 Hegel aimed to show that possession and other rights of
property exist only on the basis of mutually recognizing the princi-
ples that constitute those rights. He defended this point through the
internal criticism of the opposed natural law or "possessive individu-
alist" view.
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Although Hegel came close to Hume's view that rights are a matter
of conventions, Hegel disagreed with Hume about the nature and
philosophical import of conventions. Hume held that reason is pri-
marily analytic and deductive, that given motives and desires set the
ends of human action, and that custom was- the great guide of human
life. He therefore stressed the affective and habitual components in
the customary basis of conventions. Most significant, while Hume
justified conventions in terms of utility, Hegel justified conventions
by their contribution to actualizing freedom. This standard follows
directly from the concept of a rational will. Hegel stressed that the
will is an intellectual and rational faculty (§2iR, 258R), and he denied
that reason only analyzes and deduces. Reason legislates the funda-
mental end of human action, achieving freedom, and rationality in-
volves recognizing principles, acting on their basis, and critically as-
sessing or revising them. Consequently, Hegel stressed the rational
aspects of social conventions, especially in his discussion of the ab-
stract principles governing property and its exchange (§§i3R, 21R,
21 iR). Hegel highlighted the necessary role of mutual agreement to
principles in any system of property rights and the intellectual
achievement reflected in such agreement. Such agreement involves a
common "object" among individual wills, where that object is a set of
principles and their maintenance, since these are required for any
successful individual act that is constituted by those principles.

Simply grasping and holding an object is not an adequate example
of freedom, because it does not achieve its aim, which includes
stability of holding (§45). Mere seizure of things doesn't prohibit
others from making off with one's holdings. Possession (or owner-
ship) is distinguished from mere holding by others' recognition that
one possesses something (§51). Such recognition involves recogniz-
ing a set of principles that govern possession (§71). While such mu-
tual recognition may be implicit in simple possession, it is quite
explicit in contractual relations, because contractual relations in-
volve agreeing to the principles of contractual exchange as well as
agreeing to the particular exchange governed by a specific contract
(§§72-74).

Hegel argued that these property rights are abstract, and that they
do not constitute a self-sufficient system of actions and principles
because they generate several problems that cannot be resolved
within such an abstract system of rights. Hegel analyzed these prob-
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lems under the heading of "wrong" [Uniecht). The first problem is
that this system of principles enables agents to commit wrong acts
in the form of theft, fraud, or extortion. Hegel noted that, within this
system of rights as such, the agreement between contracting parties
is merely contingent (§81); the express contractual agreement may
be duplicitous (as in fraud) or the exchange may be forced (as in
coercion or crime). This abstract system of rights cannot of itself
train agents habitually and intentionally to uphold rather than to
violate the system of rights. This problem, which is generated on
principles internal to the abstract system of property rights (includ-
ing the fact that people make contracts to advance their personal
aims), cannot be solved within the abstract system of rights. It can
be solved only within a system of education. This is one way in
which an effective and stable system of property rights presupposes
a social ethos as one of its conditions of success.

It is possible to define wrongs against property within this abstract
system of property rights and to argue that wrong acts are incoherent
expressions of freedom. Wrongs against property are defined as acts
that violate specific rightful acts of others (§92; cf. §r26). Wrongdo-
ers, thieves, seek to own something that rightfully belongs to some-
one else. Successful theft thus presupposes a system of principles of
ownership while also violating that system of principles of owner-
ship. Therefore, thefts are incoherent expressions of freedom (§92).

It is not possible to distinguish between revenge and punishment
within the abstract system of property rights. Revenge can be de-
fined within the abstract system of property rights as the informal
exchange of bads for (alleged) bads, instead of goods for goods. The
principles that define violations are defined within the abstract sys-
tem of property rights; they simply are the system of property rights.
But in addition to principles that define violations, punishment
requires impartial application of those principles, and it requires
common recognition of the impartiality of judgment. The common
recognition of impartial judges directly anticipates social institu-
tions of courts. But courts without impartial judges are illegitimate.
Impartial judgment requires individuals to ignore their individual
circumstances and to judge according to universally valid and ac-
cepted norms (§103). This is much more stringent than can be de-
fined within the abstract system of property rights. Within the ab-
stract system of property rights, agents commit themselves to and
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act in accord with the system of property rights only insofar as doing
so enables them to achieve their private wants and desires. This is
an insufficient basis for impartiality, because impartiality may re-
quire judging to the disadvantage of one's personal interests. The
concept of a particular agent who judges impartially thus transcends
the realm of abstract property rights. Indeed, such an agent is funda-
mentally a moral agent (§104). This is the key to Hegel's transition
from "Abstract Right" to "Morality." The abstract system of prop-
erty rights is not self-sufficient because its maintenance and stabil-
ity require impartial judges, but the capacity of impartial judgment
cannot be defined or developed within the abstract system of prop-
erty rights. For this reason, the abstract system of property rights
must be augmented by moral agency and reflection.

The second part of Hegel's exposition, "Morality," has two basic
aims. The first is to enumerate a set of rights that are fundamental to
moral agency. The second is to argue that moral principles cannot be
generated or justified a priori. I treat these in turn.

Hegel distinguished between mere proprietors and moral agents,
referring to abstract proprietors as "persons" and moral agents as
"subjects." Hegel identified a number of "rights of the subjective
will." These rights are due to and required by moral subjects. These
rights include the rights only to recognize something (such as a
principle) insofar as one adopts it as one's own (§107), only to recog-
nize as valid what one understands to be good (§132), only to be
responsible for one's actions insofar as one anticipates their results
(§117), and in general to be satisfied with one's acts (§121). These
rights are due moral subjects because they are necessary to preserve
and promote the autonomy of thought and action that are required
to assess alternative courses of action, to justify and accept responsi-
bility for one's acts and their consequences, to evaluate behavior,
and to form impartial, well-reasoned judgments. Although the rights
of subjectivity are abstract (they are too general to determine any
specific injunctions or directives), they are crucial to Hegel's enter-
prise, and Hegel regarded them as crucial to humanity. The recogni-
tion of these rights marks the divide between antiquity and moder-
nity (§i24R); freedom simply isn't actual, it doesn't exist, without
the free voluntary action of moral subjects (§io6).29

One responsibility involved in moral reflection is to reflect ade-
quately on the principles, circumstances, and consequences of ac-

Context and structure of Philosophy of Right 251

tion. Hegel was aware that the rights due moral subjects just enumer-
ated, as such, allow a radical subjectivism or backsliding due to
ignorance or irresponsibility (§i32R). He insisted that moral reflec-
tion must be based on correct principles [cf. §i4oR), and he insisted
on a "right of objectivity" to the effect that agents are responsible for
the actual consequences of their acts, even if they were unintended
(§§118 & R, 120, 132R). Furthermore, important as the rights and
capacities of moral subjectivity are, Hegel held that moral reflection
alone can neither generate nor justify a set of substantive moral
principles (§25 8R). Having criticized natural law theory and utilitari-
anism elsewhere, Hegel focused his critical attention in The Philoso-
phy of Right on the two strongest remaining contenders, Kant's
ethics and the ethics of conscience. I treat these in turn.

Hegel's criticisms of Kant's moral theory are as brief and obscure
as they are crucial to his whole undertaking; only their basic import
may be indicated here. One basic issue between Hegel and Kant
concerns moral motivation. Hegel agreed with Kant that duties
ought to be done because they are duties (§133), but he disagreed
with Kant that duties ought to be done solely because they are du-
ties. Kant distinguished sharply between motives and ends of action,
and he held that the cause of action, the motive, determines the
moral worth of an action. Acting from duty is the sole morally
worthy motive. Any other motive is an inclination. While acting on
inclination may lead one to do the right act, it cannot give an act
unconditional moral worth, because inclinations only contingently
motivate right acts.3° Kant devised a special motive, "respect," just
for this case. According to Kant, respect for law is the sole rationally
generated motive. Consequently it is the sole motive that reflects
our transcendental freedom, and it is the sole motive that is entirely
self-determined.'1 Thus it contrasts with all other "heteronomous"
motives that may be caused by our (phenomenal) psychology, up-
bringing, environment, or other circumstance not chosen by us.
(Kant allowed us to perform duties out of mixed motives, as long as
the motive of respect predominates and as long as we strive to act
solely on the basis of respect.)'2

Hegel held that there can be no such pure rational motive as Kant's
"respect for law." One of his reasons is straightforward: He held that
Kant's arguments for transcendental idealism, and in particular for
the distinction between phenomena and noumena, are inadequate.
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Hence transcendental idealism provides no legitimate basis for dis-
tinguishing between the sole noumenally grounded motive of re-
spect and all other phenomenally grounded motives (that is, inclina-
tions) in the way Kant proposed. Furthermore, all else being equal,
parsimony requires a uniform account of human motivation. This
point underscores how Kant devised his account of "respect" to fit
the narrow requirements of transcendental idealism. 33 Hegel also
held that one cannot distinguish sharply between motives, as causes
of action, and the ends of action. He held that humans act on the
basis of the ends they seek to achieve, and that there are various ends
sought in any action. In addition to any specific ends, Hegel believed
that there is always a general end to any act, the end of enjoying one's
abilities. This is reflected in successfully executing one's intended
action, which results in what Hegel called "self-satisfaction" (§124
& R). If Hegel is right about this, then Kant's view that we must
abstract from all ends, determine how to act solely on the formal
requirement of the conformity of a maxim to universal lawfulness,
and perform an act solely because it is a duty, is impossible \cf. §124).
It is impossible because such an abstraction would leave us with no
reason to act, because reasons for acting always concern ends. If we
did nevertheless act, our action could not be specified on the basis of
pure dutifulness. Since Kant's requirement of doing one's duty solely
because it is a duty abstracts from all ends, it cannot have any con-
tent at all, since (Hegel held) actions are always conceived, intended,
and performed in view of ends (§13511).3*

Hegel also charged that Kant's Categorical Imperative cannot de-
termine duties unless some other principle is antecedently presup-
posed. Hegel's charge appears to rest on some crude mistakes about
Kant's test of the categorical imperative. Kant insisted, after all, that
the categorical imperative requires "anthropology" to apply it to
human circumstances." Kant's categorical imperative takes into ac-
count a wide range of logically contingent information about our
abilities, ends, and circumstances by using a principle of rational
willing, that "who wills the end, wills (so far as reason has decisive
influence on his [or her] action) also the means which are indispens-
ably necessary and in his power."36 Hegel seems to ignore this cru-
cial aspect of Kant's view.

This Kantian rejoinder does not meet Hegel's fundamental conten-
tion. Roughly put, on Kant's theory, inclinations propose and the
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categorical imperative, as a test on maxims, disposes. The main way
in which the categorical imperative disposes of maxims is by ruling
out selfish maxims, maxims that allow one to make demands on
others without allowing them to make similar demands on oneself.
Because maxims are formed in specific circumstances, in view of an
agent's desires, abilities, and available resources, Kant's test on max-
ims does presuppose a rich context of wants, ends, circumstances,
practices, and institutions. Hegel argued that the categorical impera-
tive cannot be the fundamental normative principle, because what
needs evaluation is the normative status of precisely those anteced-
ent wants, ends, social circumstances, practices, and institutions.
The idea that ends are permissible insofar as they do not violate the
categorical imperative must itself be justified by a normative analy-
sis of ends and their permissibility. Perhaps, for example, theft does
involve treating others as a mere means, but why is property legiti-
mate to begin with? Kant of course offered grounds to suppose, for
instance, that human life must be respected and that there must be
property. Human life is to be respected because humans are rational
agents and as such have an incommensurable value called "dig-
nity. "37 Property must be possible (roughly) because to regard any
object as, in principle, ownerless involves contradicting the princi-
ple that the will can and must be able to make use of anything it
needs.38 Hegel's point is that this is where the fundamental norma-
tive principles and justifications lie, not in subsequent tests of the
categorical imperative about whether our maxims are consistent
with such norms and institutions (§i35R). I must leave aside for
now issues between Kant and Hegel about the nature and adequacy
of Kant's reasoning about these more fundamental matters.

Hegel continued his argument to show that moral reflection is not
sufficient, of itself, to generate a substantive set of moral norms by
criticizing the ethics of conscience. He distinguished two forms of
conscience. One holds that conscience, of itself, is sufficient to gen-
erate a substantive set of moral norms. The other holds that con-
science is an important aspect of moral reflection that is properly
rooted in an ongoing system of social practices. Hegel called this
latter type "true conscience," and he indicated that this type was
not the object of his criticism (§137 &. R). He criticized only the
stronger type of conscience that claims normative self-sufficiency.
To repeat, Hegel's basic objection to this type of theory of con-
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science is that it cannot reliably and adequately distinguish between
subjective certainty, being convinced of something and thus conclud-
ing that it is right, and objective certainty, where the correctness of a
principle forms the basis on which one is certain of its Tightness
(§137 &. R). Subjective certainty is no guarantee of the correctness of
moral principles, yet reasoning with correct moral principles is es-
sential (§i4oR).

To recapitulate, one aim of Hegel's analysis of "Morality" was to
show that moral reflection is essential to the individual integrity
required for impartial judgment and for the stability of the system of
property conventions, and yet that moral reflection alone cannot
establish any principles of right. If Hegel was right that objective
principles cannot be justified on the basis of natural law, utility,
Kant's categorical imperative, or conscience, then he had very strong
grounds for concluding, by elimination, that the relevant standards
must be social. If Hegel substantiated these conclusions, then he
established an important pair of biconditionals: first, principles of
right can exist if and only if there is personal integrity and moral
reflection; second, there are principles of right on which to reflect if
and only if there are social practices. (Social practices were presented
abstractly in "Abstract Right" as mutually recognized principles.)
Such a system of integrated principles, practices, and morally devel-
oped agents is what Hegel called Sittlichkeit ("ethics" or "ethical

life").
Hegel explicitly stated that his argument for introducing "Ethical

Life" is regressive, since the communal phenomena analyzed in this
Part provide the ground for the possibility of the phenomena ana-
lyzed in "Abstract Right" and "Morality" (§i4iR). "Ethical Life"
analyzes a wide range of social practices that form the basis of legiti-
mate normative principles. Social practices, however, cannot occur
without social practitioners, agents who behave in accordance with
social practices and who understand themselves and others as engag-
ing in those practices. Thus these practices also include subjective
awareness on the part of agents of their own actions and the actions
of others. In "Abstract Right" Hegel argued that property rights can-
not be understood adequately or established in abstraction from sub-
jective reflection on the principles of action. In "Morality" Hegel
argued that moral reflection on principles of action cannot be under-
stood adequately or be effective apart from some set of objectively
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valid norms. In "Ethical Life" he argued that rational social life
accounts both for the validity of^objective norms and for the con-
scious knowledge and acceptance of those norms. His justification
of ethical life is that the conditions for the possibility of abstract
right and of morality are not given within the accounts of abstract
right or of morality. The conditions for their possibility - their
grounds - are provided only by ethical life.

Hegel held that normative moral, social, and political theory
should focus on rational social life because so doing solves the re-
lated problems of the possibility, the principles, and the motivation
of moral action. Since rational social life couldn't exist unless it
were practiced and supported by individuals, action in accordance
with its norms must be possible (§151), and transcendental idealism
is not required to explain the possibility of moral action. Second,
since rational social life consists of recognizable norms that guide
the action of particular people, there can be no problem in principle
about its being abstract or empty of content (§i5oR). Third, since
individuals inevitably develop their aims, desires, skills, and knowl-
edge by maturing within their particular society, they naturally tend
to develop characters and a self-understanding that value what their
rational social life promotes. Hence, by doing what their rational
social life requires, they fulfill aims essential to their own charac-
ters, and their motivation for behaving ethically is quite understand-
able (§§152-55)-

Even so, justifying Sittlichkeit as the proper locus for analyzing
human freedom and its conditions does not, of itself, solve much.
Hegel addressed several problems in his analysis of Sittlichkeit.
First, how does rationally ordered social life enable agents to achieve
their aims successfully? Second, how can the principle that one is
responsible only for the anticipated consequences of one's acts be
reconciled with the principle that one is responsible for all the conse-
quences of one's acts? Hegel proposed to reconcile these principles
by regularizing and making known the social context of individual
action, so that individuals could act knowingly and reliably succeed.
A third problem then is, how can the social context of action be
regularized and made known? Fourth, how are natural needs and
desires customized to make them rational self-given ends? Fifth,
How can political autonomy, the right to obey only those laws and
principles that one legislates for oneself, be preserved within a social
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context? finally, how do extant institutions perform the functions
required by the points just indicated?

The usual objection to Hegel's emphasis on a community's prac-
tices and standards is that it simply endorses the status quo of any
community. Two points should be made in advance. First, on He-
gel's account, not just any communal structure will do,- it must be a
structure that in fact aids the achievement of individual freedom.
This is central to his whole account of the justification of acts,
norms, and institutions; they are justified only insofar as they make
a definite and irreplaceable contribution to achieving individual free-
dom. Moreover, Hegel required that an adequate rational society
make the civil, legal, and political structure of the community
known to its members, along with how individual activities contrib-
ute to and benefit from this structure. This is crucial to preserving
political autonomy within a social context. Ultimately, Hegel re-
quired that a society be so effective at providing this knowledge and
at satisfying individual needs for objects, relations, culture, and for
belonging, that once individuals understand all of these features of
their community and their roles within it, individuals will affirm
their community as fulfilling their aims, requirements, and needs.
Only in this way can individuals freely engage in actions in their
society. This requirement stems directly from Hegel's initial analy-
sis of freedom (§7).

Because humans act collectively to promote their freedom, the
primary question of modern political philosophy, on Hegel's view, is
not a priori what institutions would fulfill these functions, but
rather how and to what extent existing institutions do fulfill these
functions. This is why Hegel analyzed the rationality of extant insti-
tutions. 3» Some of the institutions to which Hegel assigned basic
functions are now long gone, while others never developed in the
form he described. Although we may find neither merit nor likeli-
hood in the specific institutions Hegel advocated, we may still learn
much from his accounts of the functions he assigned to various
institutions and how those institutions are supposed to fulfill those
functions. I turn now to an overview of Hegel's interpretation of
modern social and political life, of the roles he assigned to the fam-
ily, civil society, and the government. (For a graphic illustration, see
the organizational chart of Hegel's state following the notes at the
end of this essay.)
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Among other things, the family provides an institutional context
for customizing and rationalizing sexual desire, and it affords a way
of fulfilling the duty to raise the next generation. This involves not
simply reproducing human organisms but raising human beings by
introducing the child to the ways and means available in one's soci-
ety for meeting basic needs and by educating the child in the princi-
ples and practices established in one's society for achieving various
purposes and upholding various rights. Customizing whatever needs
are due solely to biological and psychological nature occurs here,
through upbringing and socialization (§§174, 175). Since in modern
economies the vast majority of families do not produce for their own
subsistence, the family must have dealings with the economic and
civil life of society.

Civil society comprises the institutions and practices involved in
the production, distribution, and consumption of products that meet
a variety of needs and wants. Hegel called this the "system of needs"
(§188). The system of needs transforms natural impulses, needs, and
wants by providing socially specific goods that meet those needs and
wants, by modifying and multiplying those needs and wants (§§185,
187R, 193, 194 & R), and by inculcating the social practices through
which individuals can achieve their ends (§§182, 183, 187). Hegel
saw what atomistic individualists overlook in the division of labor:
specialization requires coordination, and coordination requires con-
formity to "the universal," to common practices (§§182, 198, 199).
(Hegel indicated that the "universal" he analyzed just are those prac-
tices, since those practices are the relations among individuals in
question [§182].) Furthermore, the collective development of social
practices, based on the joint pursuit of individual aims, is the collec-
tive development of implicit principles of right (§i87R; cf. §§260,
270). Hegel stressed the fact that these "universal" principles derive
their content from the ends and activities of particular agents who
determine for themselves what to do (§i87R). This is the most-
fundamental role individuals have in developing the content of prin-
ciples of right, in Hegel's view. Legitimate law simply codifies those
practices that require legal protection in order to remain effective
(§§209-12). In this connection he refers back to his opening endorse-
ment of Montesquieu's point that laws are justified on the basis of
their systematic interconnection within present social circum-
stances (§§2,12, 3R).
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Civil society and the economy must support the basic freedom of
choosing one's vocation (§§206, 207). Everyone has equal civil (and
later, political) rights, not on the basis of recherche grounds of the
incommensurable value of rational agency (Kant's "dignity"), but
because there is no legitimate reason to distinguish among persons
to the disadvantage of some and the advantage of others (§§36, 38,
209R, 270N3). (Hegel explicitly repudiated the antisemitism of his
conservative and liberal contemporaries [§2O9R; cf. §27oN3].)

Civil society contains three distinct kinds of institution: the Ad-
ministration of Justice, the Public Authority, and Corporations. The
Administration of Justice codifies, promulgates, and administers
statutory law. Codification makes explicit the normative principles
implicit in social practices (§§209-12; cf. § § 18 7R, 249). Promulgating
codified law contributes to informing people about the structure of
their social context of action (§§ 132R, 209, 211R, 215; cf. 228R).This
is why law must be codified and promulgated in the national language
(§216), and why judicial proceedings must be public (§§224, 228R).
The enforcement of law regularizes the context of individual action
and protects and preserves the social practices people have developed
to exercise their freedom and achieve their individual aims (§§208,
210, 218, 219). Establishing recognized courts replaces revenge with
punishment (§220).

The Public Authority is responsible for removing or remedying
"accidental hindrances" to achieving individual ends; it minimizes
and tends to the natural and social accidents that impair or disrupt
successful free individual action (§§230-33, 235). Its responsibilities
include crime prevention and penal justice (§233), price controls on
basic commodities (§236), civil engineering, utilities, and public
health (§236R), public education (§239), moderation of economic
fluctuations (including unemployment) (§236), the eradication of
the causes of poverty and poverty relief (§§240, 241, 242, 244)/0 and
the authorization and regulation of corporations (§252). If these fac-
tors are not regulated, individuals cannot plan or conduct their lives
reliably; their freedom is compromised.

The coordination among different economic agents, whether per-
sons or businesses, entails that the economy consists of sectors or
branches of industry or commerce (§201, 251). This results from the
division of labor and the distribution of specialized manufacture
across various regions of the country. In modern specialized produc-
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tion, individual jobs and businesses depend on a complex of far-flung
economic factors (§183; cf. §§182, 187, 289R, 332). Hegel recognized
this fact and sought to ensure that such factors would not hold
uncomprehended sway over people's activities and lives. Such un-
known influences limit freedom and autonomy. He addressed this
need by advocating a certain kind of professional and commercial
"corporation." These corporations are a kind of trade association,
one for each significant branch of the economy, to which all people
working in that sector belong. Membership in a corporation inte-
grates one's gainful employment explicitly into a sector of the econ-
omy and provides information about how one's sector of the econ-
omy fits with and depends on the other sectors. Corporations also
moderate the impact of business fluctuations on their members
(§§252 & R, 253 & R). Corporations counteract the divisive tenden-
cies of individual self-seeking in commerce by explicitly recognizing
individual contributions to the corporate and social good and by
bringing together people who would otherwise form two antagonis-
tic groups, an underclass of rabble and a class of elite captains of
industry who would wield inordinate social influence due to their
disproportionate wealth (§§244, 253R).

The final institution in Hegel's state is a central goverment.*1 He
distinguished between the government and the state as a whole. He
called the government the "strictly political state" (§§273, 276) and
reserved the term "state" for the whole of a civilly and politically
well-organized society (§§257-71). He called civil society - sans rep-
resentative government - "the state external" (§183). Civil society
is an "external" state because it does not fulfill the requirements of
political autonomy and because the state institutions in civil soci-
ety, the Administration of Justice and the Public Authority, are
viewed as mere instruments for achieving personal aims. The mem-
bers of civil society are bourgeois but not (as such) citizens, since
they must obey coercive laws without recognizing, and without hav-
ing public and official recognition of, their role in constituting legiti-
mate law. The Public Authority and the Administration of Justice
act on their behalf, but not under their purview. Thus the political
aspect of autonomy is not achieved within civil society [cf. §266).
Achieving political autonomy and, with that, citizenship is the pri-
mary function of Hegel's government.

Hegel ascribed sovereignty to the state as a whole, and not simply
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to the monarch or even to "the princely power" [die fiirstliche Gewalt
or "crown") as a whole (§278). No element of the state holds sover-
eignty (although each has an institutionally defined role in sover-
eignty), and no office is a private, individual possession (§§277,278R).
Hegel treated the government under the general heading of the consti-
tution. It is important to note that, although Hegel said that the
constitution ought to be viewed as eternal (§273R), he recognized that
the constitution is subject to change (§§273R, 298). What he said of
law in general holds of constitutional law as well, namely, that to be
executed, a law must be determinate. By being specific enough to be
acted upon, a law must have what Hegel called an "empirical side,"
where this empirical side is subject to change in the process of imple-
menting the law (§299R). Although this may seem to contravene the
nature of law, it does not since, as Hegel stressed, following Montes-
quieu (§3R), a law is justified by the function it presently performs
within an integrated society. As conditions change, so must laws
change in order to remain legitimate and effective (§298). In this way,
Hegel noted in his lectures, a country can gradually bring its constitu-
tion to a very different condition from where it began (§298Z).*J Hegel
regarded this not as an inevitable concession to historical contin-
gency, but as a rational process of gradual collective revision of the
legal conditions required to achieve and preserve freedom. He held
that the constitution ought to be regarded as eternal to ensure that
change results gradually from detailed knowledge of genuine need,
rather than from insufficiently informed ratiocination. He equally
held that reform must be a deliberate ongoing process, so that it does
not require revolution.

Hegel's government comprises the "princely power" or Crown,
the Executive, and the Legislature (§273). The Crown consists of a
hereditary monarch and chief ministers of state (§275). The minis-
ters formulate laws that articulate and protect the basic social prac-
tices necessary for individual free action (§283). Cabinet ministers
must meet objective qualifications (§§291, 292) and are strictly ac-
countable for their actions (§284). At their recommendation laws are
enacted by the monarch (§§275, 283, 284). The Crown protects the
interests of one's state and one's interests in the state through for-
eign policy, either by diplomacy or war (§329). The Executive admin-
isters the laws necessary for knowledgeable individual free action
(§287). The Legislature consists of an advisory body, drawn from
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high-level servants with direct ties to the Crown and the Executive
(§300), and the bicameral Estates Assembly.

Hegel assigned a quite restricted but very important role to the
Estates Assembly. The Estates Assembly provides crucial popular
insight into affairs of state (§§287, 301). In particular, the Assembly
affords popular insight into the fact that the laws enacted by the
Crown and administered by the Executive are laws that codify and
protect the social practices in which one participates and through
which one achieves one's ends [cf. §§314, 315). The Estates Assem-
bly thus places the government under popular purview (§302). Corpo-
rate representatives to the lower house of the Estates Assembly are
elected by their respective memberships (§§288, 311). Representa-
tives from the agricultural sector, landed aristocrats (§306), inherit
their right to enter the upper house (§307). Hegel based his system of
representation on the Corporations and other branches of civil soci-
ety, because doing otherwise would divide political from civil life
and leave "political life hanging in the air" (§3O3R). It must be
stressed again that citizens have a hand in developing and modifying
social practices as needed, and the law, on Hegel's view, is to follow
suit. The main function of Hegel's Estates Assembly is educative, to
inform people systematically and thoroughly about the activities of
their government and the principles, procedures, and resources for
acting within their society, so that individuals can resolve to act in
an informed and responsible manner, unencumbered insofar as possi-
ble by unexpected consequences. This education and information
enables individuals to act voluntarily and autonomously within
their society (§301 & R). Hegel expected that when people under-
stood how their society meets their needs and facilitates their ends,
they would affirm their membership in society and would act in it
willingly. The fact that the institutions of government, especially
the legislative assembly, are necessary for free, autonomous action is
their primary political justification, according to Hegel.«

Hegel opposed rule by open democratic election. He held that de-
mocracy rests too much on political sentiment (§273R), that open
elections encourage people to vote on the basis of their apparent par-
ticular interests at the expense of their interests in the community as
a whole (§§28iR, 301R), and that the tiny role each elector has in large
general elections results in electoral indifference (§31 iR). Open elec-
tions also do not guarantee that each important economic and civil
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branch of society is represented (§§303!*., 308R, 31 iR). Consequently,
open elections threaten to allow what Hegel's corporate representa-
tive system was designed to avoid: the overbearing influence of fac-
tions, especially of monied interests, on the political process (§§25 3R,
303R). Hegel also recognized that legislation requires expert knowl-
edge; he expected popular opinion to supply general ideas or feedback
about matters of detail (§3oiR). Finally, Hegel was aware of the rela-
tive political inexperience of his contemporary Germans. His civil
and political institutions were designed to provide regular, publicly
acknowledged, institutionalized channels for political education so
that people would not act in political ignorance. Hegel may have
opposed standard democratic procedures, but he was a staunch repub-
lican, and he took the vital issue of an informed body politic and
universal participation in political life much more seriously, and at a
much deeper institutional level, than any modern democracy.

Perhaps the greatest internal weakness in Hegel's organizational
scheme is his account of the monarch. Although the monarch's role
is constitutionally narrowly defined, it is also unstable. Hegel de-
fended an inherited monarchy in part because no talent is needed to
sign legislation, since the cabinet ministers are experts and are ac-
countable for the entire content of the law (§§283, 284). But he also
counted on the monarch's watchful eye from above (in conjunction
with scrutiny by the Estates Assembly from below) to hold the min-
isters responsible (§295). He can't have it both ways.

Hegel built a number of institutional guarantees into his govern-
mental structure by insisting on a division of mutually interdepen-
dent powers (§§272R, 286 & R, 301R, 308, 310 & R), and he listed a
number of fundamental civil rights (equal rights and freedoms of
person, belief, property, profession,, and trade [§§35, 36, 38, 41-49,
57, 62R, 66, 206, 207, 209R, 252, 270R]). Still, he placed the courts
under the administration of justice (§219). This would make it diffi-
cult to accommodate a doctrine of judicial review of legislative or
executive action. Hegel emphasized coordination and the coopera-
tive aspects of civil and political institutions (for instance, §§272,
303 &. R), although he insisted that cabinet ministers are strictly
responsible and accountable for their actions (§284). He did not,
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however, describe precisely how ministers are to be held account-
able. This may be because he published only the "elements" [Giund-
linien) of the philosophy of right. Hegel may have used this excuse
because insisting more explicitly on such institutions might have
brought him under official censure - or worse. When agents of the
state press for personal or factional interests, then politics becomes
contestative, as Hegel knew, and strong constitutional structures are
needed - stronger than he published - to deal with misappropria-
tions of power. 44

These sources of possible administrative recalcitrance or irrespon-
sibility raise the political specter that concerned Weber, that inde-
pendent interests generated within bureaucracies make them un-
responsive to their official obligations and constituents. Hegel did
not have the historical experience to share this concern, since in his
day the state bureaucracy was relatively new and was in the fore-
front of reform. Although this problem is not unique to Hegel's
institutions, it is a genuine and pressing problem, especially in view
of the crucial contribution Hegel's government is to make to politi-
cal freedom and autonomy.

The last problem I note concerns the actualization of Hegel's
rationally structured institutions. Hegel designed his political insti-
tutions as a bulwark against the fragmenting tendencies of eco-
nomic self-interest and the overbearing influence of economic fac-
tors on politics, especially the influence of an active and monied
entrepreneurial class. Hegel's efforts thus bear witness to the ten-
sion between sectors of the economy and a political process aimed
at universal freedom and autonomy. Historically, under pressure of
economic interests and developments, few of Hegel's institutions
developed at all, much less in the specific form he described. The
extent to which modern political institutions serve the functions
Hegel advocated cannot be explored here, but it is unlikely to be
very great, since few of them are officially assigned those functions.
By grounding legitimate law and institutions in social practices,
including those practices that are part of the economy, Hegel came
much closer to historical materialism than Marx recognized-
without being an historical materialist.-** Hegel's theory of histori-
cal change, cast in terms of the world-spirit actualizing itself by
achieving deeper self-understanding (§§342-43, 345-46), may per-
haps gloss the results or significance of some historical develop-
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ments, but it does not explain the causes or process of historical
change. In this regard, Hegel's philosophy is silent where we most
need guidance: when facing the problems of achieving genuine po-
litical freedom and autonomy through institutional reform. Hegel
outlined the basis and rationale of these ideals quite well, but his
institutional program remains an idealized image of its age. Marx's
political projections are little help, since they require transcending
the relative scarcity of goods that makes principles of justice neces-
sary. «« The persistence of relative scarcity condemns us to politics
and to the issues of bourgeois right. Hence Hegel's idealized model
retains great political relevance: To what extent do contemporary
political institutions secure and promote genuine freedom and po-
litical autonomy? To what extent ought or can they be reformed to
achieve this basic aim?*7
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He was deeply concerned with this problem and was not satisfied with
any solution to it he proposed.
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bilities, activities, and responsibilities, which, once achieved, serves as
an historical benchmark for assessing how free a society is.

44 Karl-Heinz Ilting shows that Hegel's descriptions of these mechanisms
were much more specific - and republican - in his lectures. See his intro-
duction to his edition of Die Philosophie des Rechts: Die Mitschriften
Wannemann (Heidelberg 1817/18) undHomeyer [Berlin 1818/19) (Stutt-
gart: Klett-Cotta, 1983), 25-27.

45 Marx credited Hegel with seeking the roots of government in civil
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